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Schedule B Schedule of Contributors OMB No 1545-0047
(Form 690, 990-E2,

or 990-PF) > Attach to Form 890, Form 990-EZ, or Form 990-PF. Z@'I 1
Dapartment of the Treasury

Intemal Revenue

Namo of the organkation
TRE FLORENCE S, MAHONEY FOUNDATION, INC

Employer identification numbar

C/0 CORINNE ANTLEY 52-1854092
Organization type (check one):

Fllers of: Section:

Form 830 or 980-EZ D 501(c) ) (enter number) organization

D 4947(a)(1) nonexempt charitable trust not treated as a private fournkiation

D 527 poltical organization

Form 890-PF [X] s01(c)(3) exempt private foundation

D 4947(a)(1) nonexempt charitable trust treated as a private foundation

(] 501(c)3) taxable private foundation

Check if your organization is covered by the General Rule or a Special Rule.
Note. Only a section 501(c)(7), (8), or (10) organization can check boxes for both the General Rule and a Special Rule. See
instrugtions.

Geonoral Rule

(X]

For an organization flling Form 890, €90-EZ, or 890-PF that received, during the year, $5,000 or more (in money or
property) from any one contributor. Complete Pans | and [,

Spocial Rules

"

[]

L]

For a section 501(¢)(3) organization filing Form 990 or 990-EZ that met the 33 1/3 % support test of the regulations
under sections 509(a)(1) and 170(b)(1){A)(vi) and received from any one contributor, during the year, a contribution of
the greater of (1) $5,000 or (2) 2% of the amount on (i) Form 890, Part VIii, line 1h, or (§) Form 830-EZ, line 1.
Complete Parts | and (.

For a section 501(¢)(7), (8). or (10) organization filing Form 990 or §60-EZ that received from any one contributor,
during the year, total contributions of more than $1,000 for use exclusively for religious, charitabls, scientific, fterary,
or educational purposes, or the provention of cruelty to children or animals. Complete Parts |, [l, and Il

For a section 501(c)(7), (8), or (10) organization filing Form 890 or 890-EZ that received from any one contributor,
during the year, contributiong for use exclusively for religious, charitable, etc., purposes, but these contributions did
not total to more than $1,000. 1f this box is checked, enter hers the total contributions that were received during the
year for an exclusively religious, charitable, etc., purpose. Do not complete any of the pans unless the General Rule
applles 10 this organization because it received nonexclusively religious, charitable, ete., contributions of $5,000 or

more duringtheyear . ... .. ..., .. ..., A &

Caution. An organization that is not covered by the General Rule and/or the Special Rules does not file Schedule B (Form 990,
990-E2, or 990-PF), but t must answer "No" on Part IV, line 2, of its Form 990; or check the box on fine H of its Form 990-EZ or on
Part |, line 2, of its Form 890-PF, to certify that it does not meet the filing requirementa of Schedule B (Form 860, 890-EZ, or 990-PF),

For Paperwork Reduction Act Notice, ses the Instructions for Form 990, 990<EZ, of 980-PF,

JSA
1E1281 1,000

176/2013 7:10:49 AM

Schadule B (Form 990, $90-E2, or 990-PF) {2011)

PAGE 16
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Schedule B (Form 890, 990-E2, or 590-PF) (2011) Pege 2
Name of orgenization THE FLORENCE S. MAAONEY FOUNDATION, INC Employer Identfication number

C/0 CORINNE ANTLEY 52-1854092
2 Contributors (see instructions). Use duplicate copies of Part | f additional space is needed.
(a) (b) () (d)
No. Name, address, and ZIP + 4 Total contributions Type of contribution
__31_| FLORENCE MAHONEY CHARITABLE TRUST _______ Person
Payroll
J7_MURRAY AVENUE C/0 J.M. MAHONEY ____ $ meee...26:278: | Noncasn
{Complete Part ll if there is
LARKSPOR, CR _ 24933 - cemmm—en—— a noncash contribution.)
() (b) (e) (d)
No. Name, addross, and ZIP + 4 Total contributions Type of contribution
T Person
Payroll
__________________________________________ ® o meeeeeewace—-- | Noncash
(Complete Part il if there is
------------------------------------------ a noncash contribution.)
(a) ) (¢) {d)
No. Name, addross, and ZIP + 4 Totat contributions Type of contribution
e o] mececmaa e mm s e m—— .- ———————————————————— Person
Payroll
__________________________________________ ® e eccecee—ec-- | Noncash
{(Complete Part il f there Is
__________________________________________ a noncash contribution.)
(a) (b) (c) {d)
No, Name, address, and ZIP + 4 Total contributions Type of contribution
e e e~ e mm—————— oo Person
Payroll
__________________________________________ ® e eecewc—me-= | Noncasgh
(Complete Part Il if there is
__________________________________________ a noncash contribution.)
(a) (b) . (c) (9)
No. Name, address, and ZIP + 4 Total contributions Type of contribution
T U S - v e o e Person
Payroll
.......................................... $ o _—____.| Noncash
(Complete Part [l if there is
__________________________________________ a noncash eontribution.)
(2) (v) © @
No. Name, addross, and ZIP + 4 Total contributions Type of contribution
e o m ] e e — - ———————————————— Person
Payroll
.......................................... S e cmecee—eee- | Noncash
{Complete Partli if there Is
__________________________________________ a noncash contribution.)
JSA Schodule B (Form 990, 900-£2, or 800-5F) (2011)
1E1253 1.000

1/68/2013 7:10:49 AM

PAGE 17
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Schedulo B (Form 890, 990-E2. or 890-PF) (2011) ’ Page 3
Nama of organization THE FLORENCE S. MAHONEY FOQUNDATION, INC Employar identlfication number

C/0 CORINNE ANTLEY 52~1854092

Noncash Property (see instructions). Use duplicate copies of Part |l if additional space is needed.

(a) No. {©)

from Deacription of n r(\b) h " FMV (or estimate) D © ived
Partl P of noncash property gvon (890 Instructions) ate receive

INONE.
(a) No. (c)
from (b) FMV (or estimate) ()
Part| Description of noncash property given (see instructions) Date recoivad
|
{a) No. {c)
from (&) FMV (or estimate) (d)
Part! Dexcription of noncash property given (s0d Instructions) Date received
(a) No. (c)
from _ (b) FMV (or estimate) @
Part ! Description of nancash proporty given (soe instructions) Date racoived
(a) No. {c)
from (b) FMV (or estimate) @
Part! Description of noncash property given (8ee Instructions) Dato recoived
(a) No, ()
from (b) FMV (or estimate @
Partl Doscription of noncash property given (300 gmtructlons)) Date recoived
1% Schedule 8 (Form 990, 390-E2Z, or 990-PF) (2011)
1€1254 1 000

1/8/2013 7:10:49 AM

PAGE 18
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: OMB No. 16545-0160
Form 2848 Power of Attorney T TRS Uae Oy
(. March 2012 and Declaration of Representative Receivad by:
Irtermal Raverwe Servce > Type or print. P Seo tho saparate Instructions. Name
m Pawer of Attomey Talaphone
Caution: A separate Form 2848 should be completed for each taxpayer. Form 2848 will not be honored | Function
for any purpose other than representation before tha IRS. Dats !/ /
1 Taxpayer information. Taxpayer must sign and date this form on page 2, fine 7.
T r name and address Taxpeyer idantification number(s)
The Florence S. Mahanay Foundation, Inc. .
/o Corinne M. Andey = mmwsz-wsg% e T e
1200 New Hampshire Avenue, NW, Suite 800 Daytime telephone
Waghington, DC 20036 202-776-2728

hareby appoints tha following representative(s) as attorney(s)-in-tact:
2 Reprosentative{s) must sign and date this form on page 2, Part .

Namo oddrass CAF Na. 2605-45032R
Mnmﬂ. Antloy, Dow Lahnes PLLC PTIN
;IN 2:30 h?'w H.Tvgcpshlro Avanue, NW, Suite B0O Tele No. 202.7716-2728
Fax No. . 202-776-4728
Check It 10 bo sent noticas and communications g Check if new: Adaress []  Telephone No. [] Fax No. [J
Name and adoress CAF No.
PTIN
Telephone No.
Fax No. —
Check if 1o be aent hotices and communlcations 0 Check If new: Address [ Telephone No. (] Fax No. (0
Name and address CAF No.
PTIN
Telephone No.
Fax No.
Chock I now: Addrass ]  Telephone No. [J Fax No. [
to represent the taxpayer before the Intemal Revenue Service for the following matters:
3 Maters
Description of Matier {Incoma, Employment, Payroll, Excise, Etate, Gift, Whigtioblower, Tax Form Number Year(s) or Perlod(s) (if applicable)
Praciioner Discipling, PLR, FOIA, Civil Penalty, etc.) (see Instructions for line 3) (1040, 841, 720, e1c.) (i applicable) (see Instructions for line 3)
Incomplete Return 930-PF 201
Roquost for Waiver 14720 2011, 2012, 2013

4 Specific uge not recorded on Centralized Authorization File (CAF), i the power of attomey Is for a specific use not recorded on CAF,
check this bax. See the Instructions for Line 4. Specific Uses Not RecordedonCAF . . . . T

§ Acts authorized. Unless otherwise provided Deiow, the representatives generally are authorized to recelve and Inspect oonfidential tax
Infarmation and ta parform any and all acts that | can parform with respect to the tax matters described on line 3, for example, the authority to
sign any agreements, consents, or other documents. The reprosentativels), howaver, Is (are) not authorfzad to recelve or negotiate any
amounts pald to tho clant in connaction with this represantation (Including refunds by elther electronic means or paper checks). Additionally,
unlgss the appropriats box(as) balow are chacked, the reprasantative(s) ks (are) not authorized %o exacute a request for diacioaure of tax returms
or retumn information to a third party, eubstitute another representative or add additional representatives, ar sign cartaln tax retumns.

O pisclosure 1o third parties; [ Subetitine or add reprasontativels); [ Signing a rewm;

[J Othor acts authorized:

{se0 Instructions for more information)

Exceptions. An unenralled retum praparer cannot sign any document for a taxpayer and may only raprogent taxpayers in imited situations.
An enrolled actuary may only reprasent taxpayers to the axtont provided in  saction 10.8(d) of Treasury Deparment Clrcular No. 230 (Circular
230). An envolied retirement plan agent may only represent taxpayers o the extent provded In section 10.3(e) of Clrcutar 230. A registared tax
return proparer may only reprasent taxpayers to the extent providad In saction 10.3(f) of Circular 230. Soo the line § instructions for restrictions
on tax mattors pannors. In most cases, the student practitionor's (tevel i) authority s imited (for axample, they may only practice under the
supervision of another practitionen.

List any spocific dalotions 1o the acts otherwise authorizad in this power of attomey:

For Privacy Act and Paperwork Reduction Act Notice, see the instructions. Cax No, 11680 Form 2848 Rov. 3-2012)
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"~
Form 2846 (Rev. 3-2012) Page 2

§  Retentionvrevocation of prior power(s) of attomey. The fiing of this power of attomey automatically revokes all earfler power(s) of
euomoyonmommelmemalRmnmmfmmmemdandyemorpoﬂodacowbyWsdocuanNyoudonotmm
torovoke apriorpoworofattomey, chackhafe . . . . .. . L . L . h . 0 e e e e e e e s e e . B
YOU MUST ATTACH A COPY OF ANY POWER OF ATTORNEY YOU WANT TO REMAIN IN EFFECT.

7 Signature of taxpayer. If a tax martter CONCAMS a yaar in which a joint return was filed, the husband and wife nust each flle a separate power
of attorney evon If the same representative(s) I8 (aro) being appolnted. If signed By a corporate officer, partner, guardian, tax matters partner,
executor, recelver, administrator, o7 trustee on behalf of the taxpayer, | cerntify that | have the authortty to executo this form on bohalf of the
Wxpayer.

> IF NOT SIGNED AND DATED, THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY WILL BE RETURNED TO THE TAXPAYER.

S B

Sig Title (f applicable)
Helen M. Pardoe
The Florence S. Mahoney Foundation, Inc.
a000oo
Print Name PIN Number Primt name of taxpayer fron ine 1 if other than [ndividual
Declaration of Representative

Under panaitias of perjury, | dectara that
« 1 2m not currently under suspengion or disbamment from practice before the Internal Revenue Service;
= | am aware of regulations contained in Circular 230 (31 CFR, Pant 10), as amended, conceming practice before the Intomal Revenue Service;
+ | am authorized 1o represent the taxpayor identified in Part | for the matter(s) specified there; and
* 1 am ono Of the 1ollowing:
a Azomey—a member In good standing of the bar of the highest coun of the jurisdiction shown below.
b Certified Public Accountant—duly qualified %o practice as a oertified public accountart in the fudsdiction shown balow.
¢ Enrolled Agent—enrolled as an agent under the requirernents of Clreudar 230.
d Officer—2a bona fida officer of tha taxpayer's erganization,
o Ful-Time Empioyoo—a full-ume employes of the taxpayer.

{ Family Member—a member of the taxpayer's Immediate family (for example, 8pouse, parent, child, grandparent, grandchild, step-parent, step-
chlid, brother, or sisten).

@ Enrolied Actuary~enrolied as an actuary by the Joint Board for the Enroliment of Actuaries under 290 U.S.C. 1242 (ihe suthority to practice before
the Intemal Revanue Sarvice is imited by section 10.3(d) of Clrcutar 230).
h Unonrolled Ratum Praparer—Your authority to practice before the Intemal Reverwe Service ls fimited. You must have boen oligidle to sign the

return under examination and have signed the rotum, See Notice 2011-6 and Special niles for registered tax retum preparers and unenroliod
return preparers in the instructions.

I Registered Tax Retumn Preparer—registered as a tax retum preparer under the requirements of section 10.4 of Circutar 230. Your authority to
practice before the internal Revenue Senvice 18 kmited. You must have been eligible to sign the retum under examination and have signed the
retum. See Notice 2011-8 and Speclal rules for registared tax retumn preparers and unenrolied retum preparers In the Instructions.

k Student Antomay or CPA—recelves pamission to practice before the IRS by vinue of his/her status as & law, businnss, or accounting student
worlkdng in LITC or STCP under section 10.7(d) of Clrcutar 230. See Instructions for Part il for additional Information and requiremants.

r Enrofled Retirement Plan Agent—enrolied as a retirement plan agent under the requiremants of Circutar 230 (the authority 1o practice before the
Intemal Revonue Service Is imited by section 10.3(e)).
» IF THIS DECLARATION OF REPRESENTATIVE IS NOT SIGNED AND DATED, THE POWER OF ATTORNEY WILL BE
RETURNED. REPRESENTATIVES MUST SIGN IN THE ORDER LISTED IN LINE 2 ABOVE. See the instructions for Part Il.

Nots: For designations d-f, antar your title, position, or relationship to the taxpayer In the “Licensing jurlsdiction® column, See the instructions for Part it
for more information,

Licensing juriadict Bar, Ncense, cartfication,

Deaslignation— (state) of other registration, or envollment
Insert above lleansing authortty number (f appiicable). Signature Date
lotter {omr) So0 inatructions for Part 1t for
(it applicable) more Information
£ £
‘ /
e e ), Do | /s
L’_B [ /74 !

Form 2848 Rev. 3-2012)

TOTAL P.011



