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. OMB No. 1545-0047
(srfn':%gol,jggogz, Schedule of Contributors °

or 990-PF) . > Attach to Form 990, Form 990-EZ, or Forr=, 990-PF. 2011

Department of the Treasury
Internal Revenue Service

Name of the organization Employer identification number
MANNERS GOLDEN RULE FOUNDATION 20-0526144

Organization type (check one):

Filers of: Section:

Form 930 or 990-EZ D 501(c)( ) (enter number) organization

D 4947(a)(1) nonexempt charitable trust nottreated as a private foundation
D 527 political organization

Form 990-PF @ 501(c)(3) exempt private foundation
D 4947(a)(1) nonexempt charitable trust treated as a private foundation

D 501(c)(3) taxable private foundation

Check if your organization is covered by the General Rule or a Special Rule.
Note. Only a section 501(c)(7), (8), or (10) organization can check boxes for both the General Rule and a Special Rule. See instructions.

General Rule

For an organization filng Form 990, 990-EZ, or 990-PF that received, during the year, $5,000 or more (in money or property)
from any one contnbutor. Complete Parts | and |l

Special Rules

D For a section 501(c)(3) organization filing Form 990 or 990-EZ that met the 33 1/3% support test of the regulations
under sections 509(a)(1) and 170(b)(1)(A)(vi), and recewed from any one contributor, during the year, a contribution of the greater
of (1) $5,000 or (2) 2% of the amount on (i) Form 990, Part Vil|, line 1h or (i1) Form 990-EZ, line 1. Complete Parts | and II.

D For a section 501(c)(7), (8), or (10) organization filing Form 990 or 990-EZ that received from any one contributor,
during the year, total contnbutions of more than $1,000 for use exclusively for religious, charitable, scientific,
Iterary, or educational purposes, or the prevention of cruelty to children or animals. Complete Parts |, 11, and Ill.

D For a section 501(c)(7), (8), or (10) organization filing Form 990 or 990-EZ that received from any one contributor, during
the year, contributions for use exclusively for religious, charitable, etc., purposes, but these contributions did not total
to more than $1,000. If this box is checked, enter here the total contributions that were received during the year for an exclusively
religious, charitable, etc., purpose. Do not complete any of the parts unless the General Ruleapplies to this organization because
it received nonexclusively religious, charitable, etc., contributions of $5,000 or more dunngtheyear ... .... > 3

Caution. An organization that is not covered by the General Rule and/or the Special Rules does not file Schedule B (Form 990, 890-EZ,
or 990-PF), but it must answer “No” on Part IV, line 2 of its Form 990; or check the box on line H of its Form 990-EZ or on Part |, line 2, of its
Form 990-PF, to certify that it does not meet the filing requirements of Schedule B (Form 990, 990-EZ, or 990-PF).

For Paperwork Reduction Act Notice, see the Instructions Schedule B (Form 990, 990-EZ, or 990-PF) (2011)
for Form 990, 990-EZ, or 990-PF.

JVA 11 990B1 TWF990  Copynght Forms (Software Only)- 2011 TW



Schedule B (Form 990, 990-EZ, or 990-PF) (2011)MANNERS GOLDEN RULE FOUNDA 20-0

Page 2

Name of organization
MANNERS GOLDEN RULE FOUNDATION

Employer identification number

20-0526144

Contributors (see instructions). Use duplicate copies of Part | if additional space is needed.

(a)
No.

(b)
Name, address, and ZIP + 4

(c)
Total contributions

(d)

Type of contribution

JANE DOOLY PORTER CRUT

188 D STREET

106,28

Person
Payroll
7 Noncash

Salt Lake City UT 84103

(Complete Part Il if there is
a noncash contribution.)

(a)

No.

(b)
Name, address, and ZIP + 4

(c)
Total contributions

(d)
Type of contribution

Person
Payroll
Noncash

(Complete Part Il if there is
a noncash contribution.)

(a)

No.

(b)
Name, address, and ZIP + 4

(c)
Total contributions

(d)
Type of contribution

Person
Payroll
Noncash

(Complete Part Il if there is
a noncash contribution.)

(a)

No.

(b)
Name, address, and ZIP + 4

(c)

Total contributions

(d)
Type of contribution

Person
Payroll
Noncash

(Complete Part Il if there is
a noncash contribution.)

(a)

No.

(b)
Name, address, and ZIP + 4

(c}
Total contributions

(d)
Type of contribution

Person
Payroll
Noncash

(Complete Part Il f there is
a noncash contribution.)

(a)

No.

(b)
Name, address, and ZIP + 4

()

Total contributions

(d)
Type of contribution

Person
Payroll
Noncash

(Complete Part Il if there is
a noncash contribution.)
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Schedule B (Form 990, 990-EZ, or 990-PF) (2011)



rom 2848 Power of Attorney B e Teas e
oy e 2002) and Declaration of Representative Recened by
partment of the Treasury : , :
Intemnal Revenue Service » Type or print. p- See the separate instructions. Name
Power of Attorney Telephone
Caution: A separate Form 2848 should be completed for each taxpayer Form 2848 wil not be honored Function
for any purpose other than representation before the IRS. Date Lo

1 _Taxpayer information. Taxpayer must sign and date this form on page 2, line 7.

Taxpayer name and address
MANNERS GOLDEN RULE FOUNDATION
1229 E SOUTH TEMPLE
SALT LAKE CITY uT 84102

EIN: 20-0526144

Taxpayer identification number(s)

Daytime telephone number
(801) 232-6620

Plan number (if applicable)

hereby appoints the following representative(s) as attormey(s)-in-fact:

2 Representative(s) must sign and date this form on page 2, Part Ii.

Name and address PHILLIP E OSBORNE CPA
OSBORNE ROBBINS & BUHLER, PLLC, CPAs
4527 S 2300 E, STE 201
SALT LAKE CITY, UT 84117
Check if to be sent notices and communications m

CAF No. 9000-62321

PTIN P00246568

Check if new: Address l—-l Telephone No. [—] Fax No |——l

Name and address MIRIAM K KETTLE, CPA
OSBORNE ROBBINS & BUHLER, PLLC, CPAs
4527 S8 2300 E, STE 201
SALT LAKE CITY, UT 84117

Check if to be sent notices and communications I——l

CAF No. 0200-72284

PTIN P01225984

Check if new Address [_I Telephone No l_l Fax No.ﬁ

Name and address

CAF No.
PTIN

FaxNo. ____ ______

Check if new: Address l_l Telephone No m Fax No I——[

to represent the taxpayer before the Internal Revenue Service for the following matters:

3 Matters

Description of Matter (Income, Employment, Payroll, Excise, Estate, Gift, Whistieblower,
Practitioner Discipline, PLR, FOIA, Cwl Penalty, etc ) (see instructions for line 3)

Tax Form Number
(1040, 941, 720, etc) (if applicable)

Year(s) or Penod(s) (if applicable)
(see Instructions for line 3)

INCOME TAX

FORM 990-PF

CALENDAR YEARS:
2009 - 2015

4

Specific use not recorded on Centralized Authorization File (CAF). If the power of attorney is for a specific use not recorded on CAF,
check this box. See the instructions for Line 4. Specific Uses Not RecordedonCAF_ . . . . . . . . .. .. o0 v v v v v v >

5

Acts authorized. Unless otherwise provided below, the representatives generally are authorized to receive and inspect confidential tax
information and to perform any and all acts that | can perform with respect to the tax matters described on line 3, for example, the authority to
sign any agreements, consents, or other documents. The representative(s), however, is (are) not authorized to receive or negotiate any
amounts paid to the client in connection with this representation (including refunds by either electronic means or paper checks). Additionally,
unless the appropriate box{es) below are checked, the representative(s) is (are) not authorized to execute a request for disclosure of tax returns
or retun information to a third party, substitute another representative or add additional representatives, or sign certain tax retums.

D Disclosure to third parties; D Substitute or add representative(s); D Signing a return;

[_J Other acts authonzed:

(see instructions for more information)

Exceptions. An unenrolled return preparer cannot sign any document for a taxpayer and may only represent taxpayers in hmited situations.
An enrolled actuary may only represent taxpayers to the extent prowided in section 10.3(d) of Treasury Department Circular No. 230 (Circular
230). An enrolled retirement plan agent may only represent taxpayers to the extent provided in section 10 3(e) of Circular 230. A registered tax
return preparer may only represent taxpayers to the extent provided in section 10.3(f) of Circular 230. See the line 5 instructions for restrictions
on tax matters partners. In most cases, the student practitioner's (level k) authonty is himited (for example, they may only practice under the
supervsion of another practitioner).

List any specific deletions to the acts otherwise authorized in this power of attorney: __________________________________

- ——— ————— " = = —————— = = S S P o o (o . Y T e e . o o e R e o o A . e o o e S S o T e e o S . o o o e . i i . B i . T o . .

l:gx Privacy Act and Paperwork Reduction Act Notice, see the instructions. Form 2848 (Rev 3-2012)
2X4720 1 000



Form 2848 (Rev. 3-2012) Page 2

6 Retention/revocation of prior power(s) of attorney. The filing of this power of attorney automatically revokes all earlier power(s) af
attorney on file with the Internal Revenue Service for the same matters and years or periods covered by this document If you do”
not want to revoke a prior power of attorney, checkhere . - . . . . ... ..o i i i it s e e >
YOU MUST ATTACH A COPY OF ANY POWER OF ATTORNEY YOU WANT TO REMAIN IN EFFECT.

7 Signature of taxpayer. If a tax matter concerns a year in which a jont return was filed, the husband and wife must each file a separate
power of attorney even if the same representative(s) is (are) being appointed. If signed by a corporate officer, partner, guardian, tax
matters partner, executor, receiver, administrator, or trustee on behalf of the taxpayer, | certify that | have the authority to execute this
form on behalf of the taxpayer.

» IF NOT SIGNED AND DATED, THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY WILL BE RETURNED TO THE TAXPAYER.

/8, Ny AR

ignature

Dot

PIN Number

Print name of taxpayer from line 1 if other than individual

Print Name

I Declaration of Representative

Under penalties of perjury, | declare that:
e | am not currently under suspension or disbarment from practice before the Internal Revenue Service;

® | am aware of regulations contained in Circular 230 (31 CFR, Part 10), as amended, concerning practice before the
Internal Revenue Service;

e | am authorized to represent the taxpayer identified in Part | for the matter(s) specfied there; and
® | am one of the following:

a Attorney - a member in good standing of the bar of the highest court of the jurisdiction shown below.

Certified Public Accountant - duly qualified to practice as a certified public accountant in the jurisdiction shown below
Enrolled Agent - enrolled as an agent under the requirements of Circular 230.

Officer - a bona fide officer of the taxpayer's organization.

Full-Time Employee - a full-time employee of the taxpayer

Family Member - a member of the taxpayer's immediate family (for example, spouse, parert, child, grandparent, grandchild,
step-parent, step-child, brother, or sister).

g Enrolled Actuary - enrolled as an actuary by the Joint Board for the Enroliment of Actuaries under 29 U.S C. 1242 (the authortty
to practice before the Internal Revenue Service is limited by section 10.3(d) of Circular 230).

h Unenrolled Return Preparer - Your authority to practice before the Internal Revenue Service is imited. You must have been eligible to
sign the return under examination and have signed the retum. See Notice 2011-6 and Special rules for registered tax return
preparers and unenrolled return preparers in the instructions.

i Registered Tax Return Preparer—registered as a tax return preparer under the requirements of section 10.4 of Circular 230. Your
authority to practice before the Internal Revenue Service is imited. You must have been eligible to sign the return under examination
and have signed the retum. See Notice 2011-6 and Special rules for registered tax return preparers and unenrolled return
preparers in the instructions.

k Student Attorney or CPA - receives permission to practice before the IRS by virtue of his/her status as a law, business, or accounting
student working in LITC or STCP under section 10.7(d) of Circular 230. See instructions for Part Il for addtional information and
requirements.

r Enrolled Retirement Plan Agent - enrolled as a retirement plan agent under the requirements of Circular 230 (the authority to practce
before the Internal Revenue Service is imited by section 10.3(e)).

» IF THIS DECLARATION OF REPRESENTATIVE IS NOT SIGNED AND DATED, THE POWER OF ATTORNEY WILL BE RETURNED.
REPRESENTATIVES MUST SIGN IN THE ORDER LISTED IN LINE 2 ABOVE. See the instructions for Part Il.
Note: For designations d-f, enter your title, position, or relationship to the taxpayer in the “Licensing jurisdiction" column. See the instructions
for Part Il for more information

-0 Qo0 U

Bar, license, certification,

Licensing jurisdiction registration, of

Designation - Insert
above letter (a-r)

(state) or other
licensing authority

enrollment number
(if a phcablezs See
art Il for

Signature

Date

(if applicable) e ere mfomanon
b uT 126618-2601 WQQQQJMW \ h' 5}1'—5
b UT 5062922-2601 M K—MQ}—» \/ (5/l7>

JSA
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